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Thursday, August 8, 2024 at 16:45:57 Pacific Daylight TimeThursday, August 8, 2024 at 16:45:57 Pacific Daylight Time

Subject:Subject: Re: Welcome to Caselle +$5k SignoJ!
Date:Date: Wednesday, January 11, 2023 at 9:04:09 AM Pacific Standard Time
From:From: Freya Hall
To:To: Dan Burke

I can come in. My house is loud.

On Wed, Jan 11, 2023 at 8:59 AM Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org> wrote:

Hey, did you want to do this over the phone or come here to the office?

 

Dan Burke

General Manager

(360) 622-3343

 

 

From: Freya Hall <orcas.freya@gmail.com>
Date: Tuesday, January 10, 2023 at 6:39 PM
To: Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org>
Subject: Re: Welcome to Caselle +$5k Signoff!

I'm good to go for tomorrow at 11.

See you then :-)

 

On Mon, Jan 9, 2023 at 9:10 PM Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org> wrote:

Sweet! How about Wednesday?

 

Dan Burke

General Manager

(360) 622-3343
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From: Freya Hall <orcas.freya@gmail.com>
Date: Monday, January 9, 2023 at 8:20 PM
To: Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org>
Subject: Re: Welcome to Caselle +$5k Signoff!

On Wednesday or Friday? (Either should be fine).

 

On Mon, Jan 9, 2023 at 8:19 PM Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org> wrote:

How does 11am work?

 

Dan Burke

General Manager

(360) 622-3343

 

 

From: Freya Hall <orcas.freya@gmail.com>

Date: Monday, January 9, 2023 at 2:11 PM
To: Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org>
Cc: Cortlen Nielsen <crn@caselle.com>
Subject: Re: Welcome to Caselle +$5k Signoff!

I can be available before 2pm on Wednesday or Friday this week. 

Thank you,

-Tenar

 

On Mon, Jan 9, 2023 at 12:30 PM Dan Burke <dan@eastsoundwater.org> wrote:

Hi Tenar,
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We are setting you up in Caselle for online approval of invoices over $5,000. Cortland
is helping us get you set up. I will touch base with you on the details.

 

When is a good time to connect?

 

Thanks all!

 

Dan Burke

General Manager

(360) 622-3343

 


